
 
 
 
 
 
 
Reference Number:  FOI-101004407032 
 
Response provided under: Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
Request and Response:  
 
Please provide answers on a Microsoft Excel spreadsheet. The requester 
refers to ‘older adults’ as being aged 65+ 
 
1. Does the Local Authority operate a usual cost of care for older person’s 

social services? By usual cost of care, we mean set weekly fee rates that 
the Local Authority pays to care providers for older people’s residential, 
residential EMI, nursing, and nursing EMI care.  

 
Cornwall Council does not have set weekly fee rates but does have a Usual 
Maximum Price for Care Home fees that is published each year. If you 
follow the link below you will be able to find this information: 

 
https://www.cornwall.gov.uk/health-and-social-care/adult-
commissioning-and-transformation/care-home-services/  

 
The table of figures is half way down the webpage. 
 

 
2. If the answer to question 1 is ‘yes’, does the Local Authority have a 

banding system for fee rates? By ‘banding system’ we mean different 
levels of fees according to a council’s own criteria i.e. quality grades.  

 
In April 2018 Cornwall Council introduced a Usual Maximum Price for Care 
Home fees which will continue for 2019/20. The fees agreed for 
placements are negotiated around the Usual Maximum Price taking into 
account the individual's needs. There is not a banding system. 

 
 
 
 

https://www.cornwall.gov.uk/health-and-social-care/adult-commissioning-and-transformation/care-home-services/
https://www.cornwall.gov.uk/health-and-social-care/adult-commissioning-and-transformation/care-home-services/


 
 

3.    If the answer to question 2 is ‘no’, please provide the Local Authority’s 
own set weekly fee rates for 2018/19 and 2019/20 for:  

 
 

If 'no' to question 1, what are the Local Authority fees 
for: 2018/19 2019/20 
a.     Older person’s residential  £687 £722 
b.     Older person’s residential EMI  £736 £772 
c.     Older person’s nursing  £759 £802* 
d.     Older person’s nursing EMI  £759 £802* 

 
* This figure is exclusive of Funded Nursing Care (FNC). 

 
4.    If the answer to question 2 is ‘yes’, please provide the Local Authority’s 

own weekly set fees associated with each band/grade for 2018/19 and 
2019/2020 for: 
a. Older person’s residential  
b. Older person’s residential EMI  
c. Older person’s nursing  
d. Older person’s nursing EMI  

 
N/A  

 
5.   Please provide the highest, lowest, average (mean) and median actual 

weekly fees paid to older person’s care providers in 2018/19 and 
2019/20 
 
We do not hold information to be able to specify EMI providers so are 
unable to provide a breakdown for this.  Therefore, we have included the 
figures for all providers in our response to questions A and C.  The figures 
below are the gross weekly cost to providers, for long-term placements.  
This is a total per week per provider, which may include a number of 
service users (i.e. this is not per client).  This excludes any short term 
placements, respite etc and costs relating to additional health needs.  
Please note some of the weekly costs may not relate to a full week of 
care. 
 
a. Older person’s residential  
 
Highest:  £102,809.50 
Lowest:  £242.58 
Mean:  £3,707.01 
Median:  £1,400.60 



 
 

 
b. Older person’s residential EMI  
 
Included in our response to 5a above 
 
c. Older person’s nursing  
 
Highest:  £72,549.45 
Lowest: £358.95 
Mean: £5,511.48 
Median: £2,049.28 
 
d. Older person’s nursing EMI  
 
Included in our response to 5c above 

 
We are unable to provide actual fees for 2019/2020 therefore the below 
figure is based on budgeted information.   
 
2019/2010 Gross weekly budget for 65+ Residential Care:  
£836,660.72 
 
2019/2010 Gross weekly budget for 65+ Nursing Care: 
£455,957.65 
 
For clarification, EMI stands for Elderly Mentally Infirm  
If figures for 2019/20 are not available please provide budgeted or predicted 
figures. 
The years 2018/19 and 2019/20 refer to their relevant financial years 
 
Information provided by: Adult Social Care 
 
Date of response: 26th April 2019 
 



Local Authority:
Date:

1

Does the Local Authority operate a usual cost of care for older 
person’s social services? 

2

If the answer to question 1 is ‘yes’, does the Local Authority 
have a banding system for fee rates? 

3

 If 'no' to question 1, what are the Local Authority fees for: 2018/19 2019/20
a.     Older person’s residential placement £687 £722
b.     Older person’s residential EMI placement £736 £772
c.     Older person’s nursing placement £759 £802 exclusive of Funded Nursing Care (FNC)
d.     Older person’s nursing EMI placement £759 £802 exclusive of Funded Nursing Care (FNC)

In April 2018 Cornwall Council introduced a Usual Maximum Price for Care 
Home fees which will continue for 2019/20. The fees agreed for 
placements are negotiated around the Usual Maximum Price taking into 
account the individual's needs. 

FOI Answers

Cornwall Council
26th April 2019

If data for 2019/20 is not available, please provide predicted, 
estimated, negotiated or budgeted figures where appropriate

Cornwall Council does not have set weekly fee rates but does have a Usual 
Maximum Price for Care Home fees that is published each year.  If you follow 
the link below you will be able to find this information:  
https://www.cornwall.gov.uk/health-and-social-care/adult-commissioning-and-
transformation/care-home-services/   The table of figures is half way down the 
webpage.



4
 If 'yes' to question 1, then what are the 2018/19 fees 
associated with each band for :

EXAMPLE 
Band 1 

a.     Older person’s residential placement
b.     Older person’s residential EMI placement
c.     Older person’s nursing placement
d.     Older person’s nursing EMI placement

Please also provide then the 2019/20 fees associated with each 
band for :

EXAMPLE 
Band 1

a.     Older person’s residential placement
b.     Older person’s residential EMI placement
c.     Older person’s nursing placement
d.     Older person’s nursing EMI placement

5

Please provide the highest, lowest, average (mean) and median 
actual weekly fees paid to older person’s care providers for 
2018/19 Highest (£) Lowest (£) Mean (£) Median (£)
a.     Older person’s residential placement 102,809.50 242.58 3,707.01 1,400.60
b.     Older person’s residential EMI placement
c.     Older person’s nursing placement 72,549.45 358.95 5,511.48 2,049.28

N/A as we are not answering yes to Question 1.

We do not hold information to be able to specify EMI providers so are unable to provide a breakdown for this. Therefore, we have included the 
figures for all providers in our response to questions A and C. The figures below are the gross weekly cost to providers, for long-term placements. 
This is total per week per provider, which may include a number of service users (i.e. this is not per client). This excludes any short term 
placements, respite etc and costs relating to additional health needs. Please note, some of the weekly costs may not relate to a full week of care.

included above



d.     Older person’s nursing EMI placement

Please also provide the highest, lowest, average (mean) and 
median actual weekly fees paid to older person’s care providers 
for 2019/20 Highest (£) Lowest (£) Mean (£) Median (£)
a.     Older person’s residential placement
b.     Older person’s residential EMI placement
c.     Older person’s nursing placement
d.     Older person’s nursing EMI placement

£836,660.72

£455,957.65

2019/20 -We are unable to provide the actual fees, therefore this is based on budgeted information. This figure is the overall gross weekly budget 
for 65+ Residential Care 

2019/20 - We are unable to provide the actual fees, therefore this is based on budgeted information. This figure is the overall gross weekly budget 
for 65+ Nursing Care

included above
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