

Reference Number: FOI-101004581362

Response provided under: Freedom of Information Act 2000

Request and response:

- 1. How many requests for EHCP assessments have been made in 23/07/2018-23/07/2019?**

658

- 2. How many plans were created in this period**

604

- 3. How many assessments were refused at initial request?**

54

- 4. How many plans were released after the statutory 20 week deadline?**

20

- 5. How much was spent on EHCP mediation during 23/07/2018-23/07/2019?**

The Local Authority did not pay for any formal mediations during this period.

- 6. How many EHCP mediation sessions were completed?**

None.

- 7. How many applications for appeal to first tier tribunal regarding change to content or name of provision in an EHCP were lodged during 23/07/2018-23/07/2019?**

24



8. How many first tier tribunals went ahead?

By this I take it to mean that a hearing took place = 2

9. How many were in favour of the LA?

1

10. What was the cost to the LA of processing the paperwork involved with, and attending tribunals during 23/07/2018-23/07/2019?

Information not held, as this is part of caseworker time and is not recorded and there is not internal charge for legal costs.

Information provided by: Together for Families

Date of response: 30th August 2019