
 

Information Classification: PUBLIC 

 
 
 
 
 
 
Reference Number:  101004676414 
 
Response provided under: Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
Request & Response:  
 
Request in bold: 
Response in plain text: 
 
Please could you kindly send me any information you may hold 
relating to Paupers funerals carried (sometimes referred to as 
'Public Health Act' Funerals) where persons who have died with no 
known next of kin (blood relatives) since 16/9/2019 to the day of 
your reply.  
 
Please include: 
 

1. full names of deceased persons, - withheld as per our website - 
https://www.cornwall.gov.uk/council-and-democracy/data-
protection-and-freedom-of-information/freedom-of-information-
advice/frequently-requested-information/public-health-funerals/ 

2. dates of death, - withheld as Q1 
3. marital status, -not recorded 
4. maiden surnames of married or widowed females, - withheld 

as Q1 
5. dates of birth or ages at death, - please see attached PDF.  
6. last known addresses, - withheld as Q1 
7. estimated value of estates,  - not recorded  
8. date(s) when the information was passed (or information 

that is about to be or likely to be passed) to any third party, 
if so to whom, or confirmation that this will not be 
happening and the reason why. – not recorded  

 
 
Information provided by:  Neighbourhoods & Public Protection 
 
Date of response:   27.11.19 

https://www.cornwall.gov.uk/council-and-democracy/data-protection-and-freedom-of-information/freedom-of-information-advice/frequently-requested-information/public-health-funerals/
https://www.cornwall.gov.uk/council-and-democracy/data-protection-and-freedom-of-information/freedom-of-information-advice/frequently-requested-information/public-health-funerals/
https://www.cornwall.gov.uk/council-and-democracy/data-protection-and-freedom-of-information/freedom-of-information-advice/frequently-requested-information/public-health-funerals/


Information Classification: CONTROLLED#

Public Health Funerals FOI Data
Funerals Carried out between 16/09/2019 - 25/11/2019

AGE AT DEATH REASON FOR REFERRAL FUNERAL ARRANGED FUNERAL DATE FUNERAL TYPE REFERRED TO DUCHY DATE_REFERRED_TO_DUCHY
88 No funds YES 22.11.2019 Cremation
72 NOK no funds YES 19.11.2019 Cremation
72 no NOK YES 19.11.2019 Cremation
83 NOK no funds YES 28.10.2019 Cremation

69
No funds lived with a partner 
who has no funds either YES 11.10.2019 Cremation

77 No next of kin or funds YES 10.10.2019 Cremation
90 No next of kin identified YES 10.10.2019 Cremation
74 No next of kin and funds YES 06.11.2019 Cremation
76 No NOK YES 28.10.2019 Cremation

86

NOK don't want to be 
involved as the deceased was 
estranged from the family YES 16.09.2019 Cremation
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